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Details

Make: Maxum

Model: 2600 SE Cruiser

Year: 2007

Condition: Used

Engine: , 435 hp

Engine type:  

Fuel type: Gasoline

Length: 8.23 m (27.00 ft)

Beam: 2.59 m (8.50 ft)

Cabins: 0

Berths: 0

1/10 Powered by 7zea.com

https://morganmarine.com/boat/maxum-2600-se-cruiser-10162/
https://7zea.com/boat/maxum-2600-se-cruiser-30156
https://7zea.com


Description

EN
  Maxum 2600 SE - classic 2 cabin cruiser which has just
benefited from a brand new engine complemented by 6
months warranty for the purchaser, full cut and polish to the
whole boat, stern drive serviced and re antifouling. The boat is
sumptuously appointed with seating in the spacious cockpit
and a unique turntable dual helmsman seat. This may well be
the best specified and presented example around.
Performance is exhilarating at top speed around 40 knots.
Extras include, flexi-teak swim platform, cockpit fridge and full
cockpit canopy with standing headroom. Arctic white with
black hull accent. A very popular Maxum cruiser.

Deck: Fenders and ropes. Safety pulpit rails. Round deck
hatch. Anchor locker with anchor, chain and warp. Cleats.
Opening windscreen with climb through sliding door. Opening
eye brow windows. Large swim platform with flexi-teak trim.

Cabin: 2 cabins providing two double berths. Full galley with
hot and cold water, cooker, microwave, fridge and storage.
Separate toilet with shower compartment with hot & cold
water. Toilet coupled to holding tank system. Beautiful
upholstery and woodwork with vintage decor package.

Cockpit: Large cockpit with clip-in carpets. Turntable dual
helmsman seat with seating at the port side and a sunlounger
seat at the stern. Cockpit fridge and sink unit. Full
instrumentation - volts, temperature, speed, trim, oil pressure
and fuel. Compass. Tilting steering wheel. Full canopy in black.

Electronics: Full 240v shore power system with battery
charger. 12v system with twin batteries. CD / radio with
speakers in cabin and cockpit. Flat screen TV with omni-
directional aerial. Navman 5505 GPS chart plotter. Navman
7100 DSC / VHF radio with aerial - linked to GPS. Faria depth
gauge. Nav lights. Bilge pumps. Toilet macerator and shower
pumps.

Machinery: New in June 2024 - MerCruiser 300HP MPI - V8
petrol sterndrive. Featuring twin props on the Bravo III leg.
Expect speeds of around 40 knots depending on conditions.
Automatic fire extinguisher system.

General information

Make: Maxum

Model: 2600 SE Cruiser

Year: 2007

Condition: Used

Engine

Engine: , 435 hp

Engine type:  

Fuel type: Gasoline

Measurements

Length: 8.23 m (27.00 ft)

Beam: 2.59 m (8.50 ft)

Deep: 1.02 m (3.35 ft)

Weight: 0  ()

Accommodation

Cabins: 0

Berths: 0
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 Maxum 2600 SE - port side and bow on pontoon

Maxum 2600 SE - looking out of cockpit Maxum 2600 SE - cockpit under canopy
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